
Requisition:
Requestor:

Date:
Bid No.

Bid Subject
Bid Open Date

Bid Open Time

Bid Open By

FOB Point: Minority?
Award?

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

1 Tablecloth Quantity 1 2 3 4 5
Price 130.00$            119.00$          119.00$        119.00$         119.00$                              

Freight
Shipping 25.00$              33.00$            38.00$          45.00$           52.00$                                

Setup Fee
Cost 155.00$            271.00$          395.00$        521.00$         647.00$                              

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

3

Round 
Button - 2-

1/4" Quantity 50 500 700 1000 2000
Price 2.60$                0.52$               0.51$             0.42$              0.39$                                   

Freight
Shipping

Setup Fee 50.00$              50.00$            50.00$          50.00$           50.00$                                

Cost 180.00$            310.00$          407.00$        470.00$         830.00$                              
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

5
Drawstring 
Sport Pack Quantity 50 200 300 400 500

Price No bid 2.31$               2.07$             2.07$              1.97$                                   
Freight

Shipping
Setup Fee 50.00$            50.00$          50.00$           50.00$                                

Cost No bid 512.00$          671.00$        878.00$         1,035.00$                           
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

10

Round 
Keychain 

(PVC) Quantity 100 250 500 1000 2500
Price No bid 0.98$               0.98$             0.98$              0.98$                                   

Freight
Shipping 21.65$            43.30$          86.60$           216.50$                              

Setup Fee 30.74$            30.74$          30.74$           30.74$                                
Cost No bid 297.39$          564.04$        1,097.34$      2,697.24$                           

UAPB Warehouse 1200 N. Uni. Yes
Annex Building Pine Bluff, Arkansas 

UAPB P178 Email: tamarar@artadvertisement.com
Promotional Items Fax:
Friday, September 15, 2023 Address: 2300 West Washington Jonesboro, AR 

10:00 A.M. CST

CAMPUS BID Contact: Tamara Roberson
Tuesday, August 22, 2023 Phone: 870-761-2666
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